
Marian Norwell

Inquisition taken at the City of New Sarum, 27 th August, 15 Charles I [1639], before Robert Worsham, 
gent., escheator, after the death of Marian Norwell, by the oath of John WIndover, gent., George Marshall,  
gent.,  Andrew Pewde, gent., William Mundaye, Christopher Graye, William Heyes, Walter Graye, Edward 
Falkener, William Feltam, Edward Targett, Walter Graye, Michael Wadford, Richard Easton, and Thomas 
Wilson, who say that

Marian Norwell was seised of one messuage and the site of the lately dissolved Hospital or College of St.  
Nicholas de Vanz, in or near the City of New Sarum ; and one other messuage called the Brewhouse,  
within the said City, without the gate there called the Castle Cage.

So seised, the said Marian Norwell and Robert Norwell, then her husband, by indenture tripartite dated 
19th January, 17 James I [1620], made between themselves of two parts, and Robert Jole, of New Sarum, 
tanner, son and heir of the said marian, and Joan, his wife, and Daniel Jole, elder son of the said Robert  
and Joan, of the other part, for the love which the said Robert Norwell and Marian bore to the said Robert,  
Joan, and Daniel, agreed that before the feast of Pentecost then next following they would by fine or fines  
assure the said premises to the said Daniel and his heirs, to the use of the said Marian for her life ;  and 
after her decease, as to the moiety of the said messuage called the Brewhouse, to the use of the said  
Robert Norwell for his life, with remainders successively to the said Robert Jole for life, the said Joan for 
life,  and  to  the  said  Daniel  and  his  heirs  for  ever.  As  to  the  other  moiety  of  the  said  messuage, 
immediately after the death of the said Marian, to the use of the said Joan for life, the said Robert Norwell  
for life, and the said Daniel and his heirs for ever. As to the the site of the College of Vanz and all other  
premises, after the death of the said Marian, to the use of the said Robert Jole for life, with remainder to  
the said Daniel and his heirs for ever.

Afterwards, to wit, in the Octaves of the Purification of the Blessed Mary, 17 James I [1620], a fine was  
levied at Westminster between the said Daniel Jole, plaintiff, and the said Robert Norwell and Marian, 
deforciants,  of  the  said  premises,  whereupon  the  said  Robert  and  Marian  acknowledged  the  said  
premises to be the right of the said Daniel and those which he had of their gift, and the same remised and  
quitclaimed to him and his heirs for ever.

The messuage and site of the Hospital of St. Nicholas of Vanz are held of the King in chief, by knight’s  
service, and are worth per ann., clear, 10s. The messuage called the Brewhouse is held of John Bishop of  
Salisbury, as in right of his Bishopric, by fealty and yearly rent of 2s., and is worth per ann., clear, 5s.

Marian Norwell died 14th May, 20 James I [1622] ; Robert Jole is her son and next heir, and was then  
aged 60 years and more.

Inq. P.m., 15 Charles I, v.o., No. 73
“Abstracts of Wiltshire Inquisitions Post Mortem,” 1901, edited by George S. Fry & Edw. Alex Fry.
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Inquisition

Salisbury



Additional Family Information

A. 12703. Bond by Thomas Longe of Hurcoate, co. Wilts, gentle- man, and John Mogridge of Buns 
Courte, nigh Salisbury, gentleman, to Robert Jolle and Robert Norwell, of Salisbury, brewers, in 20l., 
conditioned for the payment of 25 quarters of barley before the Purification next at Jolle's dwelling 
house in Castle street. 24 March, 34 Elizabeth, 1592. Cancelled by cuts.

'Deeds: A.12701 - A.12800', A Descriptive Catalogue of Ancient Deeds: Volume 5 (1906), pp. 366-386. 
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